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Assemble before you use:
Please assemble the feet and the body in the order given in the picture below:

1. Place the convector on the flat desk or carton.

2. Insert the 4 position holes of the feet into the position holes of the body. 

3. Tight the fixed screw to connect body and feet.

Technical parameters:

 

Features and Usage: 
A, Product structure:



 

 

B, Electric Drawing:

C, Usage:

Before using, please check if the voltage of product are the same of local place.

l Insert the plug into 230V/50Hz socket. 

l Press the switch. “O” position is off. “I” position is lower power setting; “II” 
position is higher power setting.

 N60-1: “I” is for 650W, “II” is for 1300W.

l You can change the temperature by turning the thermostat knob which from 
“MIN” to “MAX”. “MIN” position is lowest temperature, “MAX” position is highest 
temperature. 



Installation:
* When using stand unit, put the feet into the fix holes at the bottom of the unit. 
And then attach with the screws. Place the unit securely on a flat surface

* When using wall mount unit, before drilling the wall make sure the area is free of 
electrical wires or pipes. To mount your heater to the wall, use the appropriate 
screws. Reference as the pictures below:

* If there has ceiling or any articles on top of unit, the distance should be bigger 
than 600mm. The small distance will cause distortion and fire.

Notes:
1. This appliance is not intended for use by persons (including children) with 
reduced physical, sensory or mental capabilities, or lack of experience and 
knowledge, unless they have been given supervision or instruction concerning 
use of the appliance by a person responsible for their safety.

2. Children should be supervised to ensure that they do not play with the 
appliance.

3. The heater must not be located immediately below a socket-outlet. 

4. If the supply cord is damaged, it must be replaced by the manufacturer or its 
service agent or a similar qualified person in order to avoid a hazard.

5. Cover the appliance or incorrect placement will cause the fire. Do not cover 
and using convert direction.



6. Before first usage, please check your voltage and frequency is same as rating 
lable. The socket must be more than 10A for fear of any accident.

7. Before connecting the electricity, please remove the ligation wire in order to 
prevent overheating.

8. The appliance should be assembled correctly, with feet secured properly. Use 
the appliance on the flat and stable place. Do not shake the appliance during 
usage.

9. Do not use the appliance near the flammable, explosive gas and rainfall 
location. Do not use the appliance in surroundings with electricity leakage and 
fire. When the environment temperature higher than 30℃, don not use the 
appliance .Do not use the appliance when nobody is nearby.

10. Do not touch the appliance, metal surface and wind outlet during usage in 
order to avoid scald. 

Do not let children approach the heater. Always keep close supervision of 
children when in use.

11. Do not put the metal and stick into gap or wind outlet of appliance in order to 
prevent electric shock.

12. Do not use the same plug or socket-outlet with other big power appliance in 
order to avoid disaster due to overload.

13. Do not put clothes or objects, on appliance or wind outlet directly in order to 
avoid burning of the clothes and cause distortion of the unit, or poor performance.

14. While clearing the appliance, please turn off the appliance and plug-off the 
plug first, and clear after cooling down. Do not use flammable, explosive, toxic 
cleaning solvent.

15. If there is something wrong with the appliance, do not repair by yourself. It 
should be sent to the certain repair company to repair by professionals. Contact 
customer service if you have problems

16. During usage, do not open the window and door often, otherwise it will affect 
the heating function.

17. Do not use the stand unit without feet fixed.

While assembling the appliance, please stay away from curtain or the other 
flammable material. Otherwise it will cause the fire and disaster.

18. Never not turn the thermostat or switches, or plug-in / off the plug with wet 
hands for risk of electric shock.

19. Please turn off and unplug the unit while not in use for long period.

20. Do not use the appliance around the bathtub, shower and swimming pool.

21. In order to avoid overheating, do not cover the heater

22. This appliance can be used by children aged from 8 years and above and 
persons with reduced physical, sensory or mental capabilities or lack of 
experience and knowledge if they have been given supervision or instruction 
concerning use of the appliance in a safe way and understand the hazards 
involved. Children shall not play with the appliance. Cleaning and user 
maintenance shall not be made by children without supervision.

23. Children of less than 3 years should be kept away unless continuously 
supervised.



24. Children aged from 3 years and less than 8 years shall only switch on/off the 
appliance provided that it has been placed or installed in its intended normal 
operating position and they have been given supervision or instruction 
concerning use of the appliance in a safe way and understand the hazards 
involved. Children aged from 3 years and less than 8 years shall not plug in, 
regulate and clean the appliance or perform user maintenance.

CAUTION — Some parts of this product can become very hot and cause 
burns. Particular attention has to be given where children and vulnerable 
people are present.

Packing list:
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